

GOLDEN BEACH, FLORIDA

RESOLUTION NO. 1690.05

A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF GOLDEN BEACH, FLORIDA AUTHORIZING AND APPROVING PAYMENT OF LEGAL FEES AND COSTS TO STUART R. MICHELSON, ESQUIRE IN THE AMOUNT OF \$22, 493.63 PURSUANT TO INVOICES SUBMITTED ON FEBRUARY 24, 2005; PROVIDING FOR SEVERABILITY; PROVIDING FOR CONFLICT; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF GOLDEN BEACH, FLORIDA, AS FOLLOWS:

WHEREAS, the Town Council serves the residents of the Town of Golden Beach; and

WHEREAS, the Town Council members receive nominal compensation of \$1.00 annually; and

WHEREAS, it is in the interest of the Town and its residents to ensure the needs of the residents are met by the actions and directions of the Town Council; and

WHEREAS, it is the intent of the Town Council to provide coverage for legal expenses incurred by individual members of the Council when issues arise that are related to the discharge of their duties as elected officials; and

WHEREAS, the Town Council finds that a legitimate public purpose will be served by the payment of the invoices attached;

NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE TOWN COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF GOLDEN BEACH, FLORIDA, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. That the Town Council hereby authorizes payment of legal fees to Stuart R. Michelson in the amount of \$22,493.63 pursuant to the invoices as shown on composite Exhibit "A".

Section 2. Severability. That the provisions of this Resolution are declared to be severable and if any section, sentence, clause or phrase of this Resolution shall, for any reason, be held to be invalid or unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining sections, clauses, sentences and phrases of this Resolution but they shall remain in effect, notwithstanding the invalidity of any part.

Section 3. Conflict. That all resolutions or parts of resolutions in conflict with this Resolution are hereby repealed to the extent of such conflict.

Section 4. Effective Date. That this Resolution shall become effective immediately upon approval of the Town Council.

Sponsored by Administration.

The Motion to adopt the foregoing resolution was offered by Mayor Singer, seconded by Councilman Iglesias and on roll call the following vote ensued:

Mayor Singer	<u>AYE</u>
Vice Mayor Lusskin	<u>AYE</u>
Councilmember Einstein	<u>AYE</u>
Councilmember Iglesias	<u>AYE</u>
Councilmember Parus	<u>AYE</u>

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the Town Council of the Town of Golden Beach this 15th day of March, 2005.


MAYOR GLENN SINGER

ATTEST


CATHY SZABO
TOWN CLERK

APPROVED AS TO FORM
AND LEGAL SUFFICIENCY


PAUL D. EICHNER
TOWN ATTORNEY

F:\MAC\Paul's folder\Paul\Office\Golden Beach\RESOLUTION.AUTH.PMT.MICHELSON.LEGAL.FEES.ETHICS.doc

TOWN OF GOLDEN BEACH

AGENDA ITEM REPORT

AGENDA ITEM NO: 2
Meeting Date: March 15, 2005

Prepared By: Bonilyn Wilbanks-Free

SUBJECT: Approval of Stuart Michelson's Legal Bills

BACKGROUND/HISTORY:

The Town Council appointed Stuart Michelson to represent them in an appeal of fees for Ethics Complaints filed against Council Members. Mr. Michelson provided his latest invoices to the Town Attorney who has reviewed them and has submitted them to the Town for payment on behalf of Mr. Michelson

FINANCIAL IMPACT:

\$22,493.63 submitted on February 24, 2005

ATTACHMENTS:

Invoices for services
Resolution

ACTION OPTIONS/RECOMMENDATIONS:

Staff request Council to take action on this Resolution.

PAUL D. EICHNER
SAMUEL LANDOL, JR.

BAKALAR & EICHNER, P.A.

150 SOUTH PINE ISLAND ROAD, SUITE 540
PLANTATION, FLORIDA 33324-2669
TEL: (954) 475-4244 • FAX: (954) 475-4994
WWW.BANDELAW.COM

LAWRENCE WEINER,
COUNSEL
MICHAEL E. CHAPNICK,
COUNSEL

FAX COVER SHEET

To: Bonnie W-Free

Of:

Fax Number Transmitted to: 305-932-1598

Number of pages:
(including this cover sheet)

From: Paul D. Eichner, Esq.

Matter:

Date: March 3, 2005

Fax Message:

Bonnie, following please find invoices from S. Michelson. I am preparing a resolution however, in the meantime, I wanted you to have this information so that you can share it with finance, as appropriate and save a spot on the agenda.

Paul

The information contained in this facsimile message is information protected by attorney-client privilege / and or attorney/work product privilege. It is intended only for the individual named above and the privileges are not waived by virtue of this having been sent by facsimile. If the person actually receiving this facsimile or any other reader of the facsimile is not the named recipient or the employee or agent responsible to deliver it to the named recipient, any use, dissemination, distribution or copying of the communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please immediately notify us by telephone and return the original message to us at the above address via the US Postal Service.

IF YOU DO NOT RECEIVE ALL PAGES, PLEASE TELEPHONE US IMMEDIATELY AT 954-475-4244

LAW OFFICE OF
STUART R. MICHELSON
200 S.E. 13th STREET
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33316
DADE (305) 861-1000 BROWARD (954) 463-6100
TOLL FREE (866)563-6100
FACSIMILE (954) 463-5599
Email: Smichelson@Smichelsonlaw.com

Stuart R. Michelson, Esq.
James J. Birch, Esq.

Rene L. Michelson, Esq.
Of Counsel

February 24, 2005

Paul D. Eichner, Esquire
Bakalar & Eichner, PA
Westside Corporate Center
150 S. Pine Island Rd, Ste 540
Plantation, FL 33324

Re: Ethics Complaints 02-168, Al Paruas
DOAH Case No.: 04-3831EC
Our File: 2025

Dear Mr. Eichner:

Enclosed please find our invoice for fees and costs. If you should have any questions, please call me.

Very truly yours,


Stuart R. Michelson

SRM:gl
Enclosure

LAW OFFICES
STUART R. MICHELSON200 SOUTHEAST THIRTEENTH STREET
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33316
BROWARD (954) 463-6100 DADE (305) 861-1000

FAX: (954) 463-5599

February 24, 2005

Paul Eichner, Esquire
Bakalar & Eichner
Westside Corporate Center
150 S. Pine Island Rd, Ste 540
Plantation, FL 33324

INVOICE # : 42613
OUR FILE : 2025

10/21/04	Review memo from peterson re hrg date.	0.20	SRM	40.00
10/26/04	Telephone conference with Pete peterson re scheduling final hrg, determining date conflicts, witnesses, who to depose, issues and attempt to agree on available dates for March or feb.	0.40	SRM	80.00
10/27/04	Telephone conference with Paul re special mtg and strength of this case.	0.20	SRM	40.00

Continued...

10/28/04	Telephone conference with pete peterson re hrg dates, doing a stip for Hearing officer and witnesses to be deposed and strengths of cases and possibility of settlement; draft letter to pete re my conflicts; tel cw client re his availability; draft letter for pete re location of hrg.	0.80	SRM	160.00
10/28/04	Receipt and Review JOINT RESPONSE TO INITIAL ORDER	0.30	SRM	60.00
12/29/04	Review memo rec'd from client; rev file and arrange for depo of Bernard Cardona and draft letter to pete re same.	0.50	SRM	100.00
01/18/05	Review file and determine discovery to be done and draft letter to pete re depositions.	0.50	SRM	100.00
01/20/05	Telephone conference with pete peterson re depositions, scheduling and hrg and possible continuance; tel cw DOA re continuance; review motion to continue and tel cw Pete re same.	0.80	SRM	160.00
01/26/05	Review order rescheduling final hrg and draft letter to client.	0.30	SRM	60.00
02/01/05	Telephone conference with client re depo, scheduling same and predepo mtg!; review file.	0.40	SRM	80.00
02/15/05	Review file including ROI, response, Advocates rec, all evidence and affidavits, etc., and prep for predepo conf w/ client.	1.20	SRM	240.00
02/17/05	ATTEND depositions of Santaniello, Mrs Paruas and Mr. Paruas; tel cw Paul Eichner re documents.	5.50	SRM	1100.00
02/23/05	Review and respond to email from client.	0.30	SRM	60.00

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

SRM	Stuart R Michelson	Senior Partner	HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
			11.40	200.00	2,280.00
TOTAL FEES.....					\$ 2,280.00

Postage 0.60
 Photocopying - In House 4.00

Continued...

LAW OFFICE OF
STUART R. MICHELSON
200 S.E. 13th STREET
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33316
DADE (305) 861-1000 BROWARD (954) 463-6100
TOLL FREE (866) 563-6100
FACSIMILE (954) 463-5599
email: Smichelson@Smichlesonlaw.com

Stuart R. Michelson, Esq.
James J. Birch, Esq.

Rene L. Michelson, Esq.
Of Counsel

February 24, 2004

Paul Eichner
Bakalar & Eichner, PA
Westside Corporate Center
150 South Pine Island Road, Suite 540
Plantation, FL 33324

Re: Ethics Complaints - Golden Beach
Our File: 2009 - *Addicott v. Calderon*, DOAH: 04-0044FE
Our File: 2010 - *Addicott v. Calderon*, DCA: 3D04-0381
Our File: 2022 - *Addicott v. Leff*, DCA: 3D04-0382
Our File: 1086 - Combined Addicott cases pre-appeal

Dear Paul:

Enclosed please find our invoices for fees and costs on the above referenced matters. Please note that the bill on file number 1086 is due to a failure of that time to be properly billed in the past. This is due to a computer glitch. If you should have any questions, please call me.

Very truly yours,



Stuart R. Michelson

SRM:gla
Enclosure

LAW OFFICES
STUART R. MICHELSON

200 SOUTHEAST THIRTEENTH STREET
 FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33316
 BROWARD (954) 463-6100 DADE (305) 861-1000

FAX: (954) 463-6599

February 23, 2005

Paul Eichner, Esquire
 Bakalar & Eichner, PA
 Westside Corporate Center
 150 S. Pine Island Rd, Ste 540
 Plantation, FL 33324

INVOICE # : 42600
 OUR FILE : 2022

01/29/04	Receipt and Review of Order Denying Petition for Costs and Attorney's Fees (03-028)	0.80	SRM	160.00
02/03/04	Telephone conference with client re appeal issues, venue, costs and substantive law re fees; rev Rules of pro and draft notice of appeal.	1.00	SRM	200.00
02/05/04	Telephone conference with Paul Eichner re executive session.	0.20	SRM	40.00
02/06/04	Telephone conference with Paul re scheduling exec session.	0.20	SRM	40.00

Continued...

02/10/04	ATTEND executive session by phone;tel cw Paul eichner.	0.50	SRM	100.00
02/11/04	Review rules of procedure re filing notice of appeal in admin matter and review and edit notices.	0.30	SRM	60.00
04/21/04	Receipt and Review OF NEIL LEFF'S RESPONSE TO OUR MOTION FOR ENLARGMENT	0.90	SRM	180.00
05/11/04	Receipt and Review of Neil Leff's Letter to the City in reference to attorney's fees	0.30	SRM	60.00
05/18/04	Review file and relevant Rules;review all cases citing 112.317(8).work on analogies b/w couch case and this case.	2.00	SRM	400.00
05/20/04	Telephone conference with Corporal santinello;rev of docs provided by Bonnie.	0.60	SRM	120.00
06/16/04	Receipt and Review NOTICE OF APPEARANCE FOR LEFF, CRAIG TRIGOBOFF - BEACON POINTE 11-SUITE 202, 2200 NORTH COMMERCE PARKWAY, WESTON, FL 33326	0.30	SRM	60.00
06/30/04	Review Plaintiff's Supplemental memo in opposition to DV's; Review cases cited in memo	0.50	JB	82.50
06/30/04	Revise Appellate brief	0.30	JB	49.50
07/01/04	Revise statement of facts; CW SRM Re: same and issues in brief; CW MT Re: adding statutory language to brief; Research law Re: compliance with statutory requirements	1.00	JB	165.00
07/08/04	Revise Appellate Brief; CW SRM Re: issues presented in brief	1.20	JB	198.00
07/09/04	Draft insert for Appellate Brief; Review fee petition and commission order dismissing petition; Revise Draft of Appellate Brief	1.20	JB	198.00
07/14/04	Review and revise insert for brief from MT; CW RJ Re: same; Revise brief	1.90	JB	313.50
07/15/04	Research Re: Commission's ruling based on erroneous fact; Draft argument on same; CW MT Re: research for brief; Review standard of review for brief	2.20	JB	363.00

Continued...

07/19/04	Telephone conference with Leff's counsel Re: Ext of time; Revise motion for extension of time and review appellate rules; Revise Appellate Brief; Review memo's from SRM	1.70	JB	280.50
07/20/04	Revise Appeal Brief; CW SRM Re: same and issues therein; Review Index to the Record and supplement brief	1.20	JB	198.00
07/20/04	Draft and edit brief.	0.60	SRM	120.00
07/20/04	Revise Appeal Brief; CW SRM Re: same and issues therein; Review Order Denying Petition	1.20	JB	198.00
07/21/04	Revise Appellate brief	0.60	JB	99.00
07/21/04	Revise Appellate brief	0.60	JB	99.00
07/23/04	Revise App brief	0.90	JB	148.50
07/26/04	Draft Insert for App brief Re: Leff's malicious intent; CW MT Re: research and edits to Brief; revise Brief	1.10	JB	181.50
07/26/04	Draft Insert for App brief Re: case law Re: Entitled to evidentiary hearing; Research case law Re: Comm Rules analogous to motion to dismiss; CW MT Re: research and edits to Brief; Edit Brief	1.20	JB	198.00
07/28/04	Revise Appellant Brief	0.40	JB	66.00
07/29/04	Revise Appellant Brief	0.50	JB	82.50
08/01/04	Research case law regarding pleading with particularity; Review Williams v. Bear Stearns & Co., LaPesca Grande v. Moran, and other cases relating to motions to dismiss	1.00	JB	165.00
08/02/04	Draft Insert for Brief Re: case law regarding pleading with particularity	0.50	JB	82.50
08/03/04	CONFERENCE WITH RJ Re: Insert for Brief on Fixel case; Revise insert; integrate RJ memo with insert on case law regarding pleading with particularity; Revise Brief; research case law re: same	1.40	JB	231.00
08/16/04	Continued Revisions to Appellate Brief CW SRM Re: same; Review Index to Record Re: cites for brief; Review transcript of EC hearing Re: going outside four corners of petitions	1.90	JB	313.50

Continued...

08/17/04	Contiued Revisions to Appellate Brief and revamp section regarding commission abusing its descretion and put in additional case law; Draft memo to SRM on same; Shepardize additional cases cited in brief	3.00	JB	495.00
08/18/04	Review and edit brief.	0.60	SRM	120.00
08/18/04	Draft Motion for ext of time; TC with Trigoboff, RE:same.	0.30	SRM	60.00
08/19/04	Review and edit draft of brief.	0.70	SRM	140.00
08/19/04	CONFERENCE WITH MT Re: preparing record cites for brief	0.20	JB	33.00
08/23/04	Research case law Re: Standard of review; CW SRM Re: same	0.30	JB	49.50
08/24/04	Draft insert for Brief Re: Standard of review	0.30	JB	49.50
08/26/04	Revise Appellate Brief Re: standard of review; Review hearing before EC and draft insert for brief; CW MT Re: preparing table of cites and contents	1.50	JB	247.50
08/26/04	Review and edit draft.	0.60	SRM	120.00
08/27/04	Draft and edit brief and review Tr of hrg before commission.	0.70	SRM	140.00
08/27/04	Proof table of cites and cases for brief; CW SRM Re: issues pertaining to appeal; Review complaints and EC orders in detail; Revise brief; Research case law re: reversable error dismiss comp/petition based on evidence outside comp/pet	1.90	JB	313.50
08/28/04	Revise brief; Research case law and draft insert for brief re: reversable error dismiss comp/petition based on evidence outside comp/pet	1.00	JB	165.00
08/30/04	CONFERENCE WITH SRM Re: issues for app brief; Make editing changes to brief	1.00	JB	165.00
09/07/04	Draft motion for enlargement of time	0.20	JB	33.00
09/09/04	Revise Appellate Brief; Review record cites and tables	1.00	JB	165.00
09/09/04	Review and edit brief.	0.50	SRM	100.00
09/10/04	Revise Appellate brief, table of cites & contents; Prepare doc for filing; Review record cites; CW SRM Re: adding language from final order into brief	1.00	JB	165.00
09/10/04	Review and edit initial brief.	0.80	SRM	160.00

Continued...

09/13/04	Review and edit brief.	1.20	SRM	240.00
09/14/04	Revise and edit appellate brief; Research and review law re: stating a cause of action in initial pleading	2.00	JB	330.00
09/15/04	Revise and edit appellate brief	0.80	JB	132.00
09/15/04	Revise and edit appellate brief; Revise m2Supplement; CW SRM Re: Brief strategy	1.00	JB	165.00
09/16/04	Review and edit brief.	0.80	SRM	160.00
09/16/04	Draft memo for outline on oral argument; TC SRM Re: revisions to brief and motion to supplement	0.70	JB	115.50
09/16/04	Revise Appellant's initial brief and motion to supplement the record	0.80	JB	132.00
09/16/04	CONFERENCE WITH MT Re: researching malice for brief; Review cases provided by MT and include in brief	0.40	JB	66.00
09/17/04	Review and final edit brief and motion to supp record.	0.80	SRM	160.00
09/17/04	Revise and make final editing changes to appellate brief; Proof tables and brief; Proof M2Supplement; CW SRM Re: final editing to brief; Prepare documents for filing	2.00	JB	330.00
09/23/04	Review and prepare docs for transmittal to CT	0.20	JB	33.00
09/27/04	Receipt and Review dca order granting motion to supplement record	0.20	SRM	40.00
10/01/04	Telephone conference with Trigoboff Re: Brief and answer	0.20	JB	33.00
10/06/04	Receipt and Review APPELLEES UPOPOSED MOTION FOR ENLARGEMENT OF TIME WITHIN WHICH TO FILE ANSWER BRIEF	0.30	JB	49.50
10/26/04	Review and receipt of Reply Brief; CW SRM Re: Response to Reply Brief	0.50	JB	82.50
11/18/04	Draft brief and research;review answer brief and outline response.	1.30	SRM	260.00
11/19/04	Draft and edit reply brief;review record;research cases on statute.	1.70	SRM	340.00
11/22/04	Draft response to stetement of facts and draft intro;draft and edit reply brief.	1.00	SRM	200.00
12/09/04	Review and final edit reply brief.	0.80	SRM	160.00

Continued...

12/10/04	Review and final edit of reply brief, check tables, cites, etc.	1.20	SRM	240.00
12/22/04	Receipt and Review Appellee's response in opposition to appellant's motion for an award of appellante attorney's fees and costs	0.30	SRM	60.00

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

			HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
JB	James Birch	Associate	42.80	165.00	7,062.00
SRM	Stuart R Michelson	Senior Partner	21.20	200.00	4,240.00

TOTAL FEES.....\$ 11,302.00

Photocopy - In house	6.25
Photocopying - In House	6.25
Postage	0.74
Postage	0.74
Postage	0.60
Photocopying - In House	29.75
Facsimile Charges 2/3/04	8.00
Photocopying - In House	31.00
Express/Messenger Mailing	5.67
6/4/04 Federal Express	
846393707665 1/2	
Photocopying - In House	47.25
Photocopying - In House	5.00
Photocopying - In House 55	13.75
Postage	2.44
Postage	0.37
Postage	1.75
Photocopying - In House	29.75
Federal Express thru 02/16/05	12.08

TOTAL COSTS.....\$ 201.39

TOTAL FOR FEES AND COSTS.....\$ 11,503.39

AMOUNT DUE.....\$ 11,503.39

LAW OFFICES
STUART R. MICHELSON

200 SOUTHEAST THIRTEENTH STREET
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33316
BROWARD (954) 463-6100 DADE (305) 861-1000

FAX: (954) 463-5599

February 23, 2005

Paul Eichner, Esquire
Bakalar & Eichner, PA
Westside Corporate Center
150 S. Pine Island Rd, Ste 540
Plantation, FL 33324

INVOICE # : 42587
OUR FILE : 2010

01/29/04	Receipt and Review of Order Denying Petition for Costs and Attorney's Fees (02-145)	0.80	SRM	160.00
02/08/04	Research Final orders and ethics opinions Re: Substantively alleging factual underpinnings in Fee Petitions; Review case Couch v. Commission on Ethics;	1.30	JB	214.50
02/23/04	Receipt and Review RECEIPTS FROM THE 3RD DISTRICT COURT AND ITS NOTIFICATIONS AND INSTRUCTIONS. NOTICES OF APPEAL ON 02-145 AND 03-028	0.30	SRM	60.00

Continued...

05/21/04	Analysis of appellate issues and rev record and begin draft of initial brief.	2.00	SRM	400.00
05/25/04	Telephone conference with Paul re appeal issues;tel cw client re appeal issues;review record.	1.00	SRM	200.00
06/03/04	Draft and edit motion to consolidate.	1.00	SRM	200.00
06/11/04	Receipt and Review Notice of consolidating appellate cases for Addicott in Third District Court of Appeal	0.30	SRM	60.00
06/28/04	CONFERENCE WITH SRM Re: appellate brief strategy; Review draft of brief	0.20	JB	33.00
06/29/04	Revise appellate brief and CW MT Re: same	0.40	JB	66.00
06/30/04	Draft and edit initial brief.	1.40	SRM	280.00
06/30/04	Revise Appellate brief	0.30	JB	49.50
07/01/04	Draft and revise brief.	1.00	SRM	200.00
07/01/04	Revise statement of facts; CW SRM Re: same and issues in brief; CW MT Re: adding statutory language to brief; Research law Re: compliance with statutory requirements	1.00	JB	165.00
07/09/04	Review fee petition and commission order dismissing petition; Revise Draft of Appellate Brief; Draft insert for Brief	1.30	JB	214.50
07/12/04	CONFERENCE WITH MT Re: researching and drafting insert for Brief regarding amendment to fee statute; Revise Statement of facts and review index to record for cites; Review transcript of hearing before ethics board; Review Hammontree; Research law on meeting statutory requirements in petition	4.00	JB	660.00
07/13/04	Draft argument regarding meeting Apellant met statutory requirements in petitions; review Commission Rule 34-5.0291; CW MT Re: review his memo and make editing changes; Finish reviewing transcript of COE hearing	1.00	JB	165.00
07/18/04	Review and edit brief and draft memo to JB re brief edits.	1.40	SRM	280.00
07/19/04	Draft and edit brief.	1.30	SRM	260.00

Continued...

07/19/04	Telephone conference with Calderon Re: Ext of time; Revise motion for extension of time and review appellate rules; Revise Appellate Brief; Review memo's from SRM Regarding issues for brief	1.70	JB	280.50
08/18/04	ATTEND CONFERENCE WITH RJ Re: contacting Calderon	0.30	JB	49.50
10/27/04	Receipt and Review THOMAS CALDERON'S NOTICE OF ADOPTION OF APPELLEE NEIL LEFF'S ANSWER BRIEF	0.30	SRM	60.00
11/30/04	Receipt and Review DCA order on voluntary dismissal of Thomas Calderon	0.20	SRM	40.00
11/30/04	Receipt and Review DOAH order closing file of Addicott v. Calderon 04-0044FE	0.20	SRM	40.00

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

			HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
JB	James Birch	Associate	11.50	165.00	1,897.50
SRM	Stuart R Michelson	Senior Partner	11.20	200.00	2,240.00

TOTAL FEES.....\$ 4,137.50

Long Distance Telephone	0.28
Long Distance Telephone	0.28
Postage	2.22
Postage	1.06
Photocopying - In House	36.50
Postage	1.11
Postage	0.60
Facsimile Charges 2/3/04	8.00
Photocopying - In House	72.50
Express/Messenger Mailing	5.67
6/4/04 Federal Express	
846393707665 1/2	
Postage	0.37
Postage	0.37
Postage	0.37
Photocopying - In House	92.00
Long Distance Telephone	0.28
8/18/04	
Photocopying - In House	9.75
Postage	1.48
Postage	2.12
Postage	3.18

Continued...

Long Distance Telephone	0.26
9/14/04	
Photocopying - In House	65.75
Photocopying - In House 63	15.75
Postage	1.11
Federal Express thru 02/16/05	27.21
TOTAL COSTS.....	\$ 348.22
TOTAL FOR FEES AND COSTS.....	\$ 4,485.72
AMOUNT DUE.....	----- \$ 4,485.72

LAW OFFICES
STUART R. MICHELSON

200 SOUTHEAST THIRTEENTH STREET
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33316
BROWARD (954) 463-8100 DADE (305) 851-1000

FAX: (954) 463-5599

February 23, 2005

Paul Eichner, Esquire
Bakalar & Eichner, PA
Westside Corporate Center
150 S. Pine Island Rd, Ste 540
Plantation, FL 33324

INVOICE # : 42598
OUR FILE : 1086

01/08/04	Review proposed order and work on draft of response.	0.70	SRM	140.00
01/09/04	Research re fee petition and review Chapin case; draft and edit memo re Leff petition.	1.20	SRM	240.00
01/14/04	Review and edit memo re fees in 3-028.	0.30	SRM	60.00
01/14/04	Receipt and Review Memo from Staff Atty of Commission on Petition for Atty Fees	1.00	SRM	200.00
01/14/04	Receipt and Review Memo from Staff Atty of Commission on Petition for Atty Fees	1.00	ILM	200.00

Continued...

01/20/04	Receipt and Review of letter from Kay Starling re: response to petition from Neil Leff complaint no.: 02-145	0.20	SRM	40.00
01/21/04	CONFERENCE WITH ILM re strategize for hrg and rev of leff's response.	1.20	SRM	240.00
01/21/04	Travel to Tallahassee and preparation for hearing	4.00	ILM	800.00
01/22/04	ATTEND hearing at Commission on Ethics, TC with Town Attorney, TC with client	2.30	ILM	460.00
01/22/04	Travel from Tallahassee	3.00	ILM	600.00
01/23/04	Receipt and Review of Notice of Hearing from Administrative Judge Hooper and Order on Prehearing Instructions	0.30	SRM	60.00

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

			HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
ILM	Ilene L. Michelson	Partner	10.30	200.00	2,060.00
SRM	Stuart R Michelson	Senior Partner	4.90	200.00	980.00

TOTAL FEES.....\$ 3,040.00

AMOUNT DUE.....\$ 3,040.00

LAW OFFICES
STUART R. MICHELSON

200 SOUTHEAST THIRTEENTH STREET
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33316
BROWARD (954) 463-6100 DADE (305) 861-1000

FAX: (954) 463-5599

February 23, 2005

Paul Eichner, Esquire
Bakalar & Eichner, PA
Westside Corporate Center
150 S. Pine Island Rd, Ste 540
Plantation, FL 33324

INVOICE # : 42612
OUR FILE : 2009

09/14/04	Telephone conference with Calderon Re: settlement and scheduling hearing dates; TC SG Re: same; Draft letter to judge re: final hearings	0.30	JB	49.50
09/15/04	Review and Analyze depo transcript of Hernan Cardeno	0.90	JB	148.50
10/22/04	Receipt and Review notice of hearing on final hearing	0.20	SRM	40.00
10/22/04	Review correspondence from Judge Michael Parrish	0.20	SRM	40.00

Continued...

10/22/04	Revise letter to Judge Parrish Re: resetting hearing dates; CW SRM Re: analysis of merits of case; Draft memorandum summarizing case status	0.60	JB	99.00
10/23/04	Review all operative pleadings Re: Case analysis; Continue drafting memorandum Re: same	0.20	JB	33.00
10/25/04	Revise letter to Judge Parrish re: Calderon hearing scheduling.	0.10	MT	7.50
10/25/04	Review memo from JB amd cw JB re strengths and weaknesses.	0.20	SRM	40.00
10/25/04	Review letters from Parrish and Calderon;draft and edit letter to Parrish re response to calderon's letter and cw JB re same and various attempts to reach calderon.	0.50	SRM	100.00
10/25/04	Review and receipt of letter from Calderon; Draft Response thereto; Conference with SRM Re: Response and issues pertaining to Calderon	0.50	JB	82.50
10/25/04	Draft (continued) memorandum providing analysis of case; Conference with SRM Re: same	0.20	JB	33.00
10/27/04	Revise memorandum Re: analysis of ethics cases	0.20	JB	33.00
10/28/04	CONFERENCE WITH JB re strength of case and review case summary prepared by JB.	0.20	SRM	40.00
10/28/04	ATTEND mtg w/ council.	0.40	SRM	80.00
10/28/04	Revise memorandum Re: analysis of ethics cases	0.30	JB	49.50
11/01/04	Telephone conference with Calderon re settlement;draft letter to calderon re settlement.	0.70	SRM	140.00
11/02/04	Telephone conference with calderon;receipt of signed agreement by calderon;draft letter to paul re settlement.	0.40	SRM	80.00
11/04/04	Review and respond to emails from paul re settlement.	0.40	SRM	80.00
11/05/04	Telephone conference with Paul and draft letter to C Szabo.	0.30	SRM	60.00
01/28/05	Draft letter to Town of Golden Beach re: settlement check.	0.50	MT	37.50

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

		HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
James Birch	Associate	3.20	165.00	528.00
michael torres	Law Clerk	0.60	75.00	45.00
SRM Stuart R Michelson	Senior Partner	3.50	200.00	700.00

Continued...

TOTAL FEES.....\$ 1,273.00

Photocopying - In House	0.50
Service Fee Invoice 2004013387 Sterling	40.00
Photocopying - In House	2.50
Postage	0.37
Facsimile Charges	2.00
Postage	0.74
Long Distance Telephone	0.20
Postage	0.37
Postage	0.74
Photocopying - In House 12	3.00
Postage	0.37
Service Fee 008140 Sterling	30.00
Service Fee Sterling 008756	20.00
Service Fee Sterling008757	20.00
Postage	0.37
Service Fee Sterling: 11391	45.00
Service Fee Sterling: 11402	45.00
Service Fee Sterling: 11686	30.00

TOTAL COSTS.....\$ 241.16

TOTAL FOR FEES AND COSTS.....\$ 1,514.16

AMOUNT DUE.....\$ 1,514.16

LAW OFFICES
STUART R. MICHELSON

200 SOUTHEAST THIRTEENTH STREET
FORT LAUDERDALE, FLORIDA 33316
BROWARD (954) 483-8100 DADE (305) 861-1000

FAX: (954) 483-5599

February 24, 2005

Paul Eichner, Esquire
Bakalar & Eichner
Westside Corporate Center
150 S. Pine Island Rd, Ste 540
Plantation, FL 33324

INVOICE # : 42613
OUR FILE : 2025

10/21/04	Review memo from peterson re hrg date.	0.20	SRM	40.00
10/26/04	Telephone conference with Pete peterson re scheduling final hrg, determining date conflicts, witnesses, who to depose, issues and attempt to agree on available dates for March or feb.	0.40	SRM	80.00
10/27/04	Telephone conference with Paul re special mtg and strength of this case.	0.20	SRM	40.00

Continued...

10/28/04	Telephone conference with pete peterson re hrg dates, doing a stip for Hearing officer and witnesses to be deposed and strengths of cases and possibility of settlement;draft letter to pete re my conflicts;tel cw client re his availability;draft letter for pete re location of hrg.	0.80	SRM	160.00
10/28/04	Receipt and Review JOINT RESPONSE TO INITIAL ORDER	0.30	SRM	60.00
12/29/04	Review memo rec'd from client; rev file and arrange for depo of Hernan Cardeno and draft letter to pete re same.	0.50	SRM	100.00
01/18/05	Review file and determine discovery to be done and draft letter to pete re depos.	0.50	SRM	100.00
01/20/05	Telephone conference with pete peterson re depos, scheduling and hrg and possible continuance;tel cw DOA re continuance;review motion to continue and tel cw Pete re same.	0.80	SRM	160.00
01/26/05	Review order rescheduling final hrg and draft letter to client.	0.30	SRM	60.00
02/01/05	Telephone conference with client re depo, scheduling same and predepo mtg!;review file.	0.40	SRM	80.00
02/15/05	Review file including ROI, response, Advocates rec, all evidence and affidavits,etc., and prep for predepo conf w/ client.	1.20	SRM	240.00
02/17/05	ATTEND depos of Santaniello, Mrs Paruas and Mr. Paruas;tel cw Paul Eichner re documents.	5.50	SRM	1100.00
02/23/05	Review and respond to email from client.	0.30	SRM	60.00

SUMMARY OF SERVICES

		HOURS	RATE	AMOUNT
SRM	Stuart R Michelson Senior Partner	11.40	200.00	2,280.00
TOTAL FEES.....				\$ 2,280.00

Postage 0.60
 Photocopying - In House 4.00

Continued...

Long Distance Telephone	0.40
Long Distance Telephone 10/26	9.16
Long Distance Telephone	2.30
Postage	0.37
Photocopying - In House 3	0.75
Facsimile Charges 10/28	2.00
850-488-4872	
Postage	1.52
Facsimile Charges 850-488-4872	3.00
Postage	0.37
Long Distance Telephone	0.28
1/20/05	
Long Distance Telephone	0.28
1/20/05	
Long Distance Telephone	0.28
1/20/05	
Long Distance Telephone	1.00
1/26/05	
Photocopying - In House	1.50
Long Distance Telephone	0.76
Postage	0.74
Facsimile Charges 2/9	2.00
850-488-4872	
Postage 1/18	0.37
Long Distance Telephone	3.68
1/18/05	
Facsimile Charges 954-735-8015	5.00
Service Fee STERLING INV. 1882	20.00
Court Reporter Official Inv.	60.00
30040132	

TOTAL COSTS..... \$ 120.36

TOTAL FOR FEES AND COSTS.....\$ 2,400.36